
Ch. 327 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 

work conducted g pit o_f th_e transfer proceedings. 
Subd. GUARANTEE OF OUTLET; NO COMPROMISE OF EXISTING 

RIGHTS. (a) Any proceeding to transfer all or part of a drainage system to a water 
management authority must guarantee that all rights to an outlet are 
property assessed for baits on the trTsfe—r-red draifig—e_system-dfat least eqfl 
hydraulic efficiency as th_e rights t_o Q outlet that existed E me E of transfer. 

(_b) E transfer o_f a drainage system t_o a water management authority gt a 
compromise of any property right held by an owner of assessed property on the 
transferred drainage system. 

Q A_ water management authority shall compensate E owner o_f property 
assessed fo_r benefits Sm _tlE transferred drainage system for Q‘: hiss or impairment o_f E drainage rights occurring after transfer o_f 99 drainage system. 

Subd. 8. EFFECT OF TRANSFER. (a) Except as provided in this section, after 
transfer 9_f a— drainage system, g any part thedeof, to a v7ater managemefi authorityjtlie 
drainage system ceases to be subfi to_r‘egulation‘1in—der this chapter except that if only 
a portion of a drainage syst-em is trargferred, the water rhiiiagement authorityniafi 
assessed £5 improvements unddr section l03E—.215 or repairs under sections 10i'—75T 
to 103E.fi1 in the manner provided under sectmns 103E.315 and 103E.601 to 
E)3E.615. T_lre_\v2n—er management authority may manage water withigts jurisdictiona 
boundaries according to whatever law contrfithe function of the water management 
authority. The transferred drainagefitem shall become a wo—r‘l<—ah_d a responsibility o_f E transfereewater management authority. Q responsibility o_fW_e drainage authority 
fg the transferred drainage system ends. 

Q Activities conducted E transferred drainage system must continue t9 ye 
eligible §)_r z_1l_l exemptions 2_1n_c_l_ exceptions available E activities conducted public 
drainage systems under sections l03G.2241 and 103G.245. 

Subd. 9. EFFECT ON OTHER LAW. This section does not amend, supersede, 
E repeal an_y existing la_v_v providing f9_r me transfer o_f a draina—,<;e: system under 
chapter, chapter lO3D, pr other E b_l1t supplementary t_o those laws. 

Presented to the governor April 4, 2002 

Signed by the governor April 8, 2002, 2:29 p.m. 

CHAPTER 328—S.F.No. 2150 
An act relating to professions; modifying electrician licensing; requiring rulemaking; 

amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, sections 326. 01, subdivisions 5, 6g, by adding subdivisions; 
326.241, subdivision 1; 326.242, subdivisions .7, 2, 3, 5, 6, 6a, 6b, 6c, 7, 8, 10,‘ 12, by adding a 
subdivision; 326.2421, subdivisions 2, 9; 326.244, subdivisions Ia, 2, 5, 6; 326.245; Minnesota 
Statutes 2001 Supplement, section 326.243," repealing Minnesota Rules, part 38003500, subpart 
12. 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by Strikeout-.

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



549 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF MINNESOTA: 
Section 1. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, subdivision 5, is amended to 

read: 

Subd. 5. ELEGFRIGAI7 CONTRACTOR. The term “electrical contractor” 
means a person, partnership, or corporation operating a business that undertakes or 
offers to undertake to plan for, lay out, or install or to make additions, alterations, or 
repairs in the installation of electrical wiring, apparatus, or equipment for light, heat, 
power, and other purposes with or without compensation who is licensed as such by the 
board of electricity. An electrical A contractor’s license does not of itself qualify its 
holder to perform or supervise the_e1ectrical work authorized by holding any class of 
electrician’s gr 9_tlle_r personal electrical license. 

Sec. 2. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, subdivision 6g, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 6g. PERSONAL SUPERVISION. The term “personal supervision” means 
that a person licensed electrician t_o perform electrical work oversees and directs the 
electrical work performed by an unlicensed person such that: 

(1) the licensed eleeterieian person actually reviews the electrical work performed 
by the unlicensed person; 

(2) the licensed eleetrieian person is immediately available to the unlicensed 
person at all times for assistance and direction; and 

(3) the licensed eleeteieia-n person is able to and does determine that all electrical 
work performed by the unlicensed person is performed in compliance with section 
326.243. 

The licensed person is responsible for the compliance with section 
326.243 of all electrical work performed by the unlicensed person.

. 

Sec. 3. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

S_ul3c_l: DEMARCATION. “Demarcation” means listed equipment as identified 
in Minnesota Rules, part 3800.3619, such as a transformer, uninterrupfible power 
supply (UPS), batte1'y,Fo—ntro1 panel, or oTlEr device that isolates technology circuits or 
systems E nontechnology circuitsg systems, mdluding flu_g_ gr Lord gig 
connection. 

Sec. 4. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

Subd. RESIDENTIAL DWELLING. A “residential dwelling” a_n indi- 
vidual dwelling 9f 3 one-family, two-family, o_r multifamily dwelling § defined E 
National Electrical Code pursuant to section 326.243, including garage E accessory 
building. 

Sec. 5. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by sti=ikeeut=

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 550 

Subd. 6k. POWER LIMITED TECHNICIAN. The term “power limited 
technician” Eans a person having th_e necessary qualificaat-ionsfiiining, experience, 
and technical knowledge to install, alter, repair, plan, lay out, and supervise the 
fialling, altering, and regfiiring of electrical wiring, app:ratF, rm equipment 335 
technology circuits oTsystems who—is licensed as such by the boaE)f electricity.— 

Sec. 6. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

Subd. 61. TECHNOLOGY CIRCUITS OR SYSTEMS. “Technology circuits or 
systems” means class 2 or class 3 circuits or systems for, but not limited to, remog 
control, signalingqjltrofafm and audio si_gnal, incluarigfisaated comr)_onents as 
covered by National Electrical Code, articles 640, 645, 725, 760, 770, and 780 and 
which arg isolated from circuits or systemsTt‘t1eman:<:laF2Tr_cHs-s Thy: 
demarcation and are not process ccmtrol circuits or systems; antehnaand communi— 
cation circuits or systems as covered by chapter 8 (E the National ElectnT1l Code; and 
circuitry and eq_uipment for_indoor lighting and outclbmiandscape lighting systems :3 
are suppliedby the secondary circuit of an ijating power supply operating at 30 v% 
oTless as coveredby National Electrgf Code, article 411. The planning, laying out, 
insfling, altering,E1d repairing of technology circuits mygms must be perfong 
in accordance witlme applicafie requirements of the Nationalflllllectrical Code 
pursuant t_o section 326.243. 

Sec. 7. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.01, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

Subd. PROCESS CONTROL CIRCUITS OR SYSTEMS. “Process 
control circuits g systems” E circuits or systems, regardless o_f electrical classifica- 
tion, @ § integrated with a manufacturing, mining, energy, finishing, conveyance of 
equipment o_r product, material handling or packaging, process E makes g 
assembles, SE similar process. 

Sec. 8. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.241, subdivision 1, is amended to 
read: 

Subdivision 1. COMPOSITION. The board of electricity shall consist of 11 
members, residents. of the state, appointed by the governor of whom at least two shall 
be representatives of the electrical suppliers in the rural areas of the state, two shall be 
master electricians, who shall be contractors, two journeyman electricians, one 
registered consulting electrical engineer, two lieensed alarm and eemmunieatien power 
limited technicians, who shall be technology system contractors primarily engaged in 
the business of instalfi agngnd eemmuaieatien technology circuits or systems, and 
two public members as defined by section 214.02. Membership terms,_compensation 
of members, removal of members, the filling of membership vacancies, and fiscal year 
and reporting requirements shall be as provided in sections 214.07 to 214.09. The 
provision of staff, administrative services and ofiice space; the review and processing 
of complaints; the setting of board fees; and other provisions relating to board 
operations shall be as provided in chapter 214. 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by sti=ileeeut—.

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

Sec. 9. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 1, is amended to 
read: 

Subdivision 1. MASTER ELECTRICIAN. Except as otherwise provided by 
law, no person shall install, alter, repair, plan, lay out, or supervise theinstalling, 
altering, or repairing of electrical wiring, apparatus, or equipment for light, heat, 

power, or other purposes unless the person is: (a) licensed by the board as a master 
electrician and (b)(i) the electrical work is for a licensed electrical contractor and the 
person is an employee, partner, or oflicer of, or is the licensed electrical contractor, or 
(ii) the electrical work is performed for the person’s employer on electric wiring, 
apparatus, equipment, or facilities owned or leased by the employer which is located 
within the limits of property which is owned or leased and operated and maintained by 
the employer. 

(1) An applicant for a Class A master electrician’s license shall (a) be a graduate 
of a four-year electrical course in an accredited college or university; or (b) shall have 
had at least one year’s experience, acceptable to the board, as a licensed journeyman; 
or (c) shall have had at least five years’ experience, acceptable to the board, in planning 
for, laying out, supervising and installing wiring, apparatus, or equipment for electrical 
light, heat and power. 

(2) As of August 1, 1985, no new Class B master electrician’s licenses shall be 
issued. An individual who has a Class B master electrician’s license as of August 1, 
1985 may retain the license and exercise the privileges it grants, which include 
electrical work limited to single phase systems, not over 200 arnperes in capacity, on 
farmsteads or sing1e—family dwellings located in towns or municipalities with fewer 
than 2,500 inhabitants. 

Sec. 10. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 2, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 2. JOURNEYMAN ELECTRICLAN. (a) Except as otherwise provided 
by law, no person shall install, alter, repair, or supervise the installing, altering, or 
repairing of electrical wiring, apparatus, or equipment for light, heat, power, or other 
purposes unless: 

(1) the person is licensed by the board as a journeyman electrician; and 

(2) the electrical work is: 

(i) for an electrical a contractor and the person is an employee, partner, or oflicer 
of the licensed electrical contractor; or 

(ii) performed under the supervision of a master electrician also employed by the 
person’s employer on electrical wiring, apparatus, equipment, or facilities owned or 
leased by the employer that is located within the limits of property owned or leased, 
operated, and maintained by the employer. 

(b) An applicant for a Class A journeyman electrician’s license shall have had at 
least four years of experience, acceptable to the board, in wiring for, installing, and 
repairing electrical wiring, apparatus, or equipment, provided however, that the board 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by strileeeut-.

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



~ 

552 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002
~ 

Ch. 328

~ 

may by rule provide for the allowance of one year of experience credit for successful 
completion of a two-year post high school electrical course approved by the board.

~ 
’(c) As of August 1, 1985, no new Class B journeyman e1ectrician’s licenses shall 

be issued. An individual who holds a Class B journeyman electrician’s license as of 
August 1, 1985 may retain the license and exercise the privileges it grants, which 
include electrical work limited to single phase systems, not over 200 amperes in 
capacity, on farmsteads or on single—family dwellings located in towns or municipali- 
ties with fewer than 2,500 inhabitants.

~ 

~~ 

~~

~ 
Sec. 11. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 3, is amended to 

read: 

Subd. 3. CLASS A INSTALLER. Notwithstanding the provisions of subdivi~ 
sions 1, 2, and 6, any person holding a class A installer license may lay out and install 
and supervise the laying out and installing of electrical wiring, apparatus, or equipment 
for major electrical home appliances on the load side of the main service on farmsteads 
and in any town or municipality with fewer than 1,500 inhabitants, which is not 
contiguous to a city of the first class and does not contain an established business of

~ 

~~

~

~

~

~ an eleetrieal a contractor. 

Sec. 12. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, is amended by adding a 
subdivision to read: 

Subd. 3d. POWER LIMITED TECHNICIAN. (a) Except as otherwise provided 
by lag p—terson shall install, alter, repair, plan, layfirt, or sup_ervise the installing, 
Wering,—or repairiflif electrical wiring, appar21Es,—or' aplipment foTtechnology 
circuits o_rsystems unless: 

_— -

~ 

~~~ 

~~

~

~ 
9 th_e person licensed Q E board E a power limited technician; £1

~ 
(2) the electrical work is: 

Q f_or a licensed contractor _a_n_c_l t_h_e person an employee, partner, pr ofiicer pg 
or is the licensed contractor; or~

~

~ 

(ii) performed under the supervision of a master electrician or power limited 
technician alfi employed Egg person’s employer 92 technology arcuits, systems, 
apparatus, equipment, or facilities owned or leased by the employer that is located 
within the limits of pE)perty owned or Eased, opgafi, and mainfiled by the 
employeT 

_ _ — — —
~

~

~

~

~ 
Q Q applicant E a power limited technician’s license shall Q E a graduate 

of a four—year electrical course in an accredited college E university; o_r 9 have had E least 36 months experience,—a-cEptable to the board, in planning for, laying 63?, 
§1pTvi-sfi, and installing wiring, apparatus,_or—e(}uipment_@ power lifited systemjs, 
provided hoxger, that the board may by rule_provide for the allowance of up to 12 
months (2,000 hours):of§pfmceE<iFfor—successfulEmfietion of a twwo‘-);ar_1LE 
high school electricalcourse E other techmcal training approved b_y—Qe board.

~ 

~

~ 

~~

~

~ 
Q E board E initially s_et experience requirements without rulemaking, b_u_t 

must adopt rules before :l_u_l_y 1_, 2003. 

~~ New language is indicated by underline, deletions by seéleeeut-.

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

(d) Licensees must attain eight hours o_f continuing education acceptable t_o th_e 
board every renewal period. 

(e) A person who has achieved a minimal score of 70 percent on an alarm and 
cominuni7:ation exrninfim administered by the board before April—35,- 2003, IE 
obtain a power .limited technician license without further examination by submitting an 
application and a license &_e 5% 

_ — 
(f) A company holding an alarm and communication license as of June 30, 2003, 

may -clesiignate one person WE may oEn a power limited techniaanlicensewithout 
}?ssing an exafination ad%ist73d b_y @ board by submitting 31 application and 
license E3 o_f 

F‘ 

Sec. 13. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 5, is amended to 
read:

' 

Subd. 5. UNLICENSED PERSONS. (a) An unlicensed person shall not perform 
electrical work unless the work is performed under the personal supervision of an 
electrician a person actually licensed to perform such work and the licensed electrician 
and unlicehsed persen persons are employed by the same employer. Licensed 
eleetrieians persons shall not permit unlicensed persons to perform electrical work 
except under the personal supervision of an electrician a person actually licensed to 
perform such work. Unlicensed persons shall not supervise the performance of 
electrical work or make assignments of electrical work to unlicensed persons. Licensed 
electricians Except for technology circuit or system work, licensed persons shall 
supervise no more thfitwo unlicensed person_s. For technology circuit or system work, 
licensed persons shall supervise no more than three unlicensed persons. 

(b) Notwithstanding any other provision of this section, no person other than a 
master electrician g power limited technician shall plan or lay out electrical wiring, 
apparatus, or equipment for light, heat, power, or other purposes, except circuits or 
systems exempted personal licensing by subdivision lg paragraph

_ 
(c) Eleetrieal Contractors employing unlicensed persons performing electrical 

work shall maintain records establishing compliance with this subdivision, which shall 
designate all unlicensed persons performing electrical work, except for persons 
working on circuits or systems exempted from personal licensing by subdivision 12, 
paragraph—Q)_, and shall permit the board_t_o_examine and copy afsuch records3s 
provided for in section 326.244, subdivision 6. 

Sec. 14. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 6, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 6. ELEG1IlRIGAJ= CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE REQUIRED. Except 
as otherwise provided by law, no person other than an employee, partner, or ofiicer of 
a licensed electrical contractor, as defined by section 326.01, subdivision 5, shall 
undertake or ofier to undertake to plan for, lay out, supervise or install or to make 
additions, alterations, or repairs in the installation of electrical wiring, apparatus, and 
equipment for light, heat, power, and other purposes with or without compensation 
unless the person obtains an a contractor’s license. An electrical 5 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA. for 2002 554 

contractor’s license does not of itself qualify its holder to perform or supervise the 
electrical work authorized by holding any class of eleetrieianis personal electrical 
license. 

Sec. 15. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 6a, is amended to 
read: - 

Subd. 6a. BOND REQUIRED. Each electrical contractor shall give and maintain 
bond to the state in the penal sum of $5,000 conditioned upon the faithful and lawful 
performance of all work entered upon by the contractor within the state of Minnesota 
and such bond shall be for the benefit of persons injured or suffering financial loss by 
reason of failure of such performance. The bond shall be filed with the board and shall 
be in lieu of all other license bonds to any political subdivision. Such bond shall be 
written by a corporate surety licensed to do business in the state of Minnesota. 

Sec. 16. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 6b, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 6b. INSURANCE REQUIRED. Each electrical contractor shall have and 
maintain in effect general liability insurance, which includes premises and operations 
insurance and products and completed operations insurance, with limits of at least 
$100,000 per occurrence, $300,000 aggregate limit for bodily injury, and property 
damage insurance with limits of at least $25,000 or a policy with a single limit for 
bodily injury and property damage of $300,000 per occurrence and $300,000 aggregate 
limits. Such insurance shall be written by an insurer licensed to do business in the state 
of Minnesota and each electrical contractor shall‘ maintain on file with the board a 
certificate evidencing such insurance which provides that such insurance shall not be 
canceled without the insurer first giving 15 days written notice to the board of such 
cancellation. - 

Sec. 17. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 6c, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 6c. EMPLOYMENT OF MASTER ELECTRICIAN OR POWER 
LIMITED TECHNICIAN. (a) No electrical contractor shall engage Eausiness of 
electrical contracting unless the electrical contractor employs a licensed Class A master 
or Class B master electrician, g power limited technician, who shall be responsible for 
the, performance of all electrical work in accordance with the requirements of sections 
326.241 to 326.248 or any rule or order adopted or issued under these sections. The 
classes of work for which the licensed eleetrieal contractor is authorized shall be 
limited to those for which such Class A master electrician, or Class B master 
electrician, E power limited technician employed by the eleetrieal contractor is 

licensed. 

(b) When an eleetrieal a contractor’s license is held by an individual, partnership, 
limited liability company, or‘ corporation and the individual, one of the partners, one of 
the members, or an officer of the corporation, respectively, is not the responsible rI—1a_sta‘ 
electrician or power limited technician of record, all requests for inspection shall be 
signed by HE responsible master electrician E power limited technician of record. The 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



~ 

~~~

~

~

~

~ 

555 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

designated responsible master electrician or power limited technician of record shall be 
employed by the individual, partnershilf limited liability company, or corporation 
which is applying for an electrical a contractor’s license and shall not be employed in 
any capacity as a licensed electrician g licensed technician by any other electrical 
contractor or employer designated in subdivision 12. 

(c) All applications for electrical contractor’s licenses and all renewals shall 

include a verified statement that the applicant or licensee has complied with this 
subdivision. 

Sec. 18, Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 7, is amended to 

~~

~
~
~
~
~
~
~ 
~
~ 
~~~ 

~~ 

~
~ 
~~~~ 

~~~

~ 
~ ~ 
~~~~ 

~ 
~~ 

read: 

Subd. 7. EXAMINATION. In addition to the requirements imposed herein and 
except as herein otherwise provided, as a precondition to issuance of an eleetrieianis 
a personal license, each applicant must pass a written or oral examination given by the 
board to insure the competence of each applicant for license. An oral examination shall 
be administered only to an applicant who furnishes a written statement from a certified 
teacher or other professional, trained in the area of reading disabilities stating that the 
applicant has a specific reading disability which would prevent the applicant from 
performing satisfactorily on a written test. The oral examination shall be structured so 
that an applicant who passes the examination will not impair the applicant’s own safety 
or that of others while acting as an a licensed person. No person failing an 
examination may retake it for six months thereafter, but within such six months the 
person may take an examination for a lesser grade of license. Any licensee failing to 
renew a license for two years or more after its expiration shall be required to retake the 
examination before being issued a new license. ' 

Anapplieantferjeumeyman%erspeeialeleetAeianisHeensewheshaH£urmsh 
ewdeneesaésfaaewtethebeardefhwiagdaemquisimaeperieneequpenwfifien 
applieatmmpaymemeftheexammafiefifeemdfulfihmentofauotherrequfiemenm 
stawdherem;mayweAeasajeameymanerspeeialeleetéeimmtflflaeaan&natmn 
nextfenemdngandtheanneuneememefthemsulmefwehlatmrwmminatienbythe 
beard: 

An applicant fg a personal license shall submit t_o tlg board E application a_md_ 
examination fe_e at the time _of application. Upon approval 9f the application, tlf board 
shall schedule the applicant for the next available examination, which shall be held 
within §_Q days; '_1‘_l§ applicant shall be allowed one opportunity to reschedule an 
examination without being required?) stibmit anoth£pplication and—examination fa 
Additionally, an applicant who f_ai_l_s__ an examination, or whose efwlication has bfi 
disapproved, {Fist submit 2316-ther apfication a_ncl_ examination fee. 

—: 
Sec. 19. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 8, is amended to 

read: 

Subd. 8. LICENSE AND RENEWAL FEES. All licenses issued hereunder shall 
expire in a manner as provided by the board. Fees, as set by the board, shall be payable 
for examination, issuance and renewal of the following: 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002
~ 

(1) For examination:
~

~ 
Class A Master; 
Class B Master. 

~~ Class A Journeyman, Class B Journeyman, Installer, Alarm and Communications 
Contractor, Power Limited Technician, or Special Electrician.

~ 

(2) For issuance of original license and renewal:
~

~ 
Class A Master. 
Class B Master.E 
Class A Journeyman, Class B Journeyman, Installer, or Special Electrician. 

~~

~

~ 
Electrical contractor. 

Alarm and Communication System Contractor. 
~~ - Technology Systems Contractor.

~ 
Sec. 20. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 10, is amended to 

read: 

Subd. 10. CONTINUATION OF BUSINESS BY ESTATES. Upon the death of 
a master who is an electrical a contractor the board may permit the decedent’s 
representative to carry on the business of the decedent for a period not in excess of six 
months, for the purpose of completing work under contract or otherwise to comply 
with sections 326.241 to 326.248. The representative shall give such bond as the board 
may require conditioned upon the faithful and lawful performance of such work and 
such bond shall be for the benefit of‘ persons injured or suffering financial loss by 
reason of failure of such perfonnance. Such bond shall be written by a corporate surety 
licensed to do business in the state of Minnesota. Such representative shall also comply 
with all public liability and property damage insurance requirements imposed by this 
chapter upon a licensed electrical contractor. 

~ 

~ 

~~ 

~ 

~ 

~ 

~ 

~ 

~~ 

~~ 

Sec. 21. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.242, subdivision 12, is amended to 
read:

~ 

Subd. 12. EXEMPTIONS FROM LICENSING. (a) A maintenance electrician 
who is supervised by the responsible master electrician foran eleetiaieal a contractor 
who has contracted with the maintenance electrician’s employer to provideservices for 
which an eleetrieal :1 c0ntractor’s license is required or by a master electrician or an 
electrical engineer registered with the board and who is an employee of an employer 
and is engaged in the maintenance, and repair of electrical equipment, apparatus, and 
facilities owned or leased by the employer, and performed within the limits of property 
which is owned or leased and operated and maintained by said employer, shall not be 
required to hold or obtain a license under sections 326.241 to 326.248; or 

~~~ 

~ 

~ 

~ 

~

~ 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by sn=ikeeut—.

~~

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

(b) Employees of a licensed alarm and eommunieatien electrical or technology 
systems contractor or other employer where provided supervisiorT by a master 
electrician in accordaice with subdivision 1, or power limited technician inaccordance 
with subdivision 3d, paragrefah (a), clauseTl)_,are not required to hold alicense under 
sections 3262413326248 wiaE‘pe;repm'rn"g werk autheri-zed to be conducted by an 
alarm and communication contractor for the planning, laying out, installing, altering, 
and repairing of technology circuitsbirsystems except plflning, laying out, or 
installing: 

M — ~# _ 
(1) in other than residential dwellings, class 2 or class 3 remote control circuits 

that control circuits or systems other Er class 2 or class 3, except circuits that 
Erconnect these sys_tems through communfcathnn, alarm, and security systemsare 
exempted flo_m_ paragraph; 

— — 
9 class 2 Q class 3 circuits electrical cabinets, enclosures, E devices 

containing physically unprotected circuits other than class 2 E class pr 

Q technology circuits gig systems hazardous classified locations § covered 
by chapter 5 of the National Electrical Code; or 

2 and class 3 remote control wiring associated with plug g cord E plug connected 
appliances other man security gr fire alarm systems installed _a 

residential dwelling E not required t_o hold a license under sections 326.241 t_o 326.248; or 
Q Heating, ventilating, air conditioning, and refrigeration contractors and their 

employees g n_ot required to_hold or obtainTlicense under sections 32E4fi 
326.248 when performing heat‘in—g~,—\7en—t‘ilating, air conditioning, or refrigeration wofi 
as described in section 326.245; or 

W W 
(e) (e) Employees of any electric, communications, or railway utility, cable 

commu11ic—ations company as defined in section 238.02, or a telephone company/—as 
defined under section 23731 or its Jnployees, or of any independent contractor 
performing work on behalf of any such utility, cable communications company, or 
telephone company, shall not be required to hold a license under sections 326.241 to 
326.248: 

1. While performing work on installations, materials, or equipment which are 
owned or leased, and operated and maintained by such utility, cable communications 
company, or telephone company in the exercise of its utility-, antenna, or telephone 
function, and which

' 

(i) are used exclusively for the generation, transformation, distribution, transmis- 
sion, or metering of electric current, or the operation of railway signals, or the 
transmission of intelligence and do not have as a principal function the consumption 
or use of electric current or provided service by or for the benefit of any person other 
than such utility, cornmunications, or telephone company, and 

(ii) are generally accessible only to employees of such utility, cable communica- 
tions, or telephone company or persons acting under its control or direction, and 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 558 

(iii) are not on the load side of the meter service point o_r point of entrance; or 

2. While performing work on installations, materials, or equipment which are a 
part of the street lighting operations of such utility; or 

3. While installing or performing work on outdoor area lights which are directly 
‘connected to a utility’s distribution system and located upon the utility’s distribution 
poles, and which are generally accessible only to employees of such utility or persons 
acting under its control or direction; or 

(d) Q An owner shall not be required to hold or obtain a license under sections 
326.241 to 326.248. 

Sec. 22. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.2421, subdivision 2, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 2. EXEMPTION. Exeept as provided in 3; No person 3' 
company exempt under subdivision 1 or licensed pursuant to 3 section 
326.242, subdivision 4 or 6, may be Equired to obtain any authorization, permit, 
franchise, or license fr—om: SE pay any fee, franchise tax, or other assessment to, any 
agency, department, board, or political subdivision of the state as a condition for 
performing any work described herein. $1-1e requirements of this seetien shall not apply 
wtelephe%%mpamesasdefineduaderseefien2%%0laerwtheirempleyee&thatMe 

Sec. 23. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.2421, subdivision 9, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 9. LIMITATION. Nothing in this section prohibits a unit of local 
government from charging a franchise fee to the operator of a cable communications 
system company Q defined section 238.02. 

Sec. 24. Minnesota Statutes 2001 Supplement, section 326.243, is amended to 
read: 4 

326.243 SAFETY STANDARDS. 
All electrical wiring, apparatus and equipment for electric light, heat and power, 

alarm and eemmu-n-ieatien technology circuits g systems shall comply with the rules 
of the department of commerce or the department of labor and industry, as applicable, 
and be installed in conformity with accepted standards of construction for safety to life 
and property. For the purposes of this chapter, the rules and safety standards stated at 
the time the work is done in the then most recently published edition of the National 
Electrical Code as adopted by the National Fire Protection Association, Inc. and 
approved by the American National Standards Institute, and the National Electrical 
Safety Code as published by the Institute of Electrical and Electronics Engineers, Inc. 
‘and approved by the American National Standards Institute, shall be prima facie 
evidence of accepted standards of construction for safety to life and property; provided 
further, that in the event a Minnesota Building Code is formulated pursuant to section 
l6B.61, containing approved methods of electrical construction for safety to life and 
property, compliance with said methods of electrical construction of said Minnesota 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by stiileeeut:
V

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



~

~ 

5'59 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

Building Code shall also constitute compliance with this section, and provided further, 
that nothing herein contained shall prohibit any political subdivision from making and 
enforcing more stringent requirements than set forth herein and such requirements 
shall be complied with by all licensed electricians working within the jurisdiction of 
such political subdivisions. 

Sec. 25. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.244, subdivision la, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. la, ALARM AND TECHNOLOGY SYSTEMS. 
(a) The installation of fire alarm systems as defined in article 17-60 of the National 
Eleetiéeal Cede; t_he technology circuits g systems described paragraph except: 

Q2 minor work performed by a contractor;; 

Q work performed by _a heating, ventilating, g conditioning contractor as 
described in section 326.245; and 

(_32 work performed by cable company or telephone company employees, 
must be inspected as provided in this section for compliance with the applicable 
provisions of artieles 12-5; 469, 57—7(+, 809; 840; and 829 of the mast recent edition of the 
National Electrical Code and the applicable provisions ‘of the National Electrical Safety 
Code, as those codes were approved by the American National Standards Institute; 

(_b2 Tire inspection requirements paragraph E2 apply E 
(1) remote control circuits controlling class 2 or class 3 remote control circuits 

that cmitrol circuits or systems other than class.—2or cTas.—s_Z:1nd indoor lighting, except 
cifiuits that interconiiect these %rIis:exWpted_l)y sectiorr§26.242, subdivision 12, 
paragraplfib), other than fire alarm; class 2 or class 3 circuits in electrical cabinet-s‘, 
enclosures,_(§7 dew/i—ces_c:—c>_nE1ing phyazfily rmprotected circuits_<-ather than class 2 or 
class 3; or teghnology circuits and systems in hazardous classified locatiorisasgii/e_rQ 
by chapter‘ 5 of the" National Efictrical _(_Z‘_o§e_;

_ 
Q E alarm systems a_s_ defined article ’_7_6Q 9_f_g13 National Electrical Code; 

Q2 critical health and medical facilities, including, b_11t n_ot limited to, anesthesia 
an_d resuscitative alarm and alerting systems, medical monitoring, and nurse call 
systems; a_n<_l 

Q physical security systems within detention facilities. 
(c) For the purposes of this subdivision “minor work” means the adjustment or 

repair and replacement of worn or defective parts of an alarm er eemmunieatien a 
technology circuit or system, Minor work may be inspected under this section at the 
request of the owner of the property or the person doing the work. 

(d) Notwithstanding this subdivision, if an electrical inspector in the eeurse of 
eleing another inspeetien in a building observes that an alarm and eemmunieatien a 
contractor, employer, or owner has not complied with accepted standards when the 
work was per'formed, as provided in the most recent editions of the National Electrical 
Code and the National Electrical Safety Code as approved by the American National 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by strilceeut:

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 560 

Standards Institute, the inspector may order the contractor, employer, or owner who 
has performed the work to file a request for electrical inspection, pay an inspection fee, 
and make any necessary rep—a—ir_s to comply with applicable standards and requireE 
Ework be inspected. ‘ 

Sec. 26. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.244, subdivision 2, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 2. PROCEDURE. (a) At or before commencement of any installation 
required to be inspected by the board, the electrical contractor, installer, special 
electrician, or owner making the installation shall submit to the board a request for 
inspection, in a form prescribed by the board, together with the fees required for the 
installation. 

(b) The fees required are a handling fee and an inspection fee. The handling fee 
shall be set by the board in an amount sufficient to pay the cost of printing and handling 
the form requesting an inspection. The inspection fee shall be set by the board in an 
amount sufficient to (pay the actual costs of the inspection and the board’s costs in 
administering the inspection. All fees shall be set pursuant to the procedure of sections 
14.001 to 14.69. 

(c) If the inspector finds that the installation is not in compliance with accepted 
standards of construction for safety to life and property as required by section 326.243, 
the inspector shall by written order condemn the installation or noncomplying portion 
thereof, or order service to the installation disconnected, and shall send a copy of the 
order to the board. If the installation or the noncomplying part will seriously and 
proximately endanger ‘human life and property, the order of the inspector, when 
approved by the- inspector’s superior, shall require immediate condemnation or 
disconnection. In all other cases, the order of the inspector shall permit a reasonable 
opportunity for the installation to be brought into compliance with accepted standards 
of construction for safety to life and property prior to the effective time established for 
condemnation or disconnection.

' 

(d) Copies of each conderrmation or disconnection order shall be served 
personally or by mail upon the property owner, and the electrical contractor, installer, 
or special electrician makingthe installation, and other persons as the board by rule 
may direct. An aggrieved party may appeal any condemnation or disconnection order 
by filing with the board a notice of appeal within ten days after (1) service upon the 
aggrieved party of the condemnation or disconnection order, if this service is required, 
or (2) filing of the order with the board, whichever is later. The appeal shall proceed 
and the order of the inspector shall have the effect the order, by its terms, and the rules 
of the board provides. The board shall adopt rules providing procedures for the conduct 
of appeals, including provisions for the stay of enforcement of the order of the 
inspector pending such appeal when justified by the circumstances. 

Sec. 27. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.244, subdivision 5, is amended to 
read: - 

Subd. 5. EXEMPTIONS FROM INSPECTIONS. Installations, materials, or 
equipment shall not be subject to inspection under sections 326.241 to 326.248: 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by strikeeut:

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



~

~

~ 

~~~~

~

~

~

~

~

~ 

~~~

~
~
~ 
~
~
~
~ 
~
~ 
~
~
~ ~ ~~ ~~ ~ ~ 
~~~ 

~~~

~~ 

561 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 328 

(1) when owned or leased, operated and maintained by any employer whose 
maintenance electricians are exempt from licensing under sections 326.241 to 326.248, 
while performing electrical maintenance work only as defined by board rule; 

(2) when owned or leased, and operated and maintained by any electric, 

communications or railway utility or telephone company in the exercise of its utility or 
telephone function; and 

(i) are used exclusively for the generations, transformation, distribution, trans- 
mission, or metering of electric current, or the operation of railway signals, or the 
transmission of intelligence, and do not have as a principal function the consumption 
or use of electric current by or for the benefit of any person other than such utility or 
telephone company; and 

(ii) are generally accessible only to employees of such utility or telephone 
company or persons acting under its control or direction; and - 

(iii) are not on the load side of the meter service point pr point o_f entrance; 

(3) when used in the street lighting operations of an electric utility; 
(4) when used as outdoor area lights which are owned and operated by an electric 

utility and which are connected directly to its distribution system and located upon the 
utility’s distribution poles, and which are generally accessible only to employees of 
such utility or persons acting under its control or direction; 

(5)whentheinstaHatien;materiakandequipmentarealarmereemmunieafien 
systems laid out; installed; or maintained within residential units not larger than a 
durleae 

66) when the installation, material, and equipment are in facilities subject to the 
jurisdiction of the federal Mine Safety and Health Act; or 

(179 (6) when the installation, material, and equipment is part of an elevator 
installation for which the elevator contractor, licensed under section 326.242, is 

required to obtain a permit from the authority having jurisdiction as provided by 
section 16B.747, and the inspection has been or will be performed by an elevator 
inspector certified by the department of administration and licensed by the board of 
electricity. This exemption shall apply only to installations, material, and equipment 
permitted or required to be connected on the load side of the disconnecting means 
required for elevator equipment under National Electric Code Article 620, and elevator 
communications and alarm systems within the machine room, car, hoistway, or 
elevator lobby. 

Sec. 28. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.244, subdivision 6, is amended to 
read: 

Subd. 6. SITE INSPECTIONS. The board may, without advance notice, inspect 
any site at which electrical work is being performed or has been performed or where 
records concerning the performance of electrical work are kept for purposes of 
ensuring compliance with sections 326.241 to 326.248 or any rule or order adopted or 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by strileeout:

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



Ch. 328 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 562 

issued under these sections. With respect to electrical work performed at or records 
kept in an occupied private dwelling, all inspections permitted by this subdivision shall 
occur during normal business hours and shall be preceded by advance notice, which 
need not be in writing. The -board shall have the authority to examine and copy all 
records concerning the performance of electrical. work and to question in private all 
persons employed by an eleetrieal a contractor or on the site. No person shall retaliate 
in any manner against any employee or person who is questioned by, cooperates with, 
or provides information to the board, its complaint committee, or the attorney general. 

Sec. 29. Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 326.245, is amended to read: 

326.245 MANUFACTURING, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, OR RE- 
PAIR OF ELECTRICAL APPARATUS; EXEMPT. 

Subdivision 1. MANUFACTURERS. Electrical components, apparatus, or 
appliances being m_anufactured within the limits of property which is owned or leased 
by a manufacturer and such manufacturer’s production employees shall are not be 
covered by sections 326.241 to 326.248. Installation; alteration; or repair 
apphan%unim;exeept€a9eleen&ealwningmtheuni&er€b)efigmalwh4ngmeren 
theunitinstalledeutsidefliefimitsefprepertywhiehisewneéerleasedbya 
manu£aemrershaHnetbeeeveredbythisehapm£Ferpurpesesefthisseetien; 

Subd. 2. ELECTRICAL APPLIANCE UNITS. Installation, alteration, or repair 
of electrical_appliance units are not covered by sections 326.241 to 326.24s.“F6?EE 
purposes of this section, “ele<IicEappliancei1.nits” means all elecfical and fos.sTlfE 
applianceftfiuse electricity including, but not limited tgfurnaces, %er heatT, 
stoves, clot%vEhers, dryers, and dishwEh$ The inst-afiation of electrical wiring 
t_o an electrical appliance i§Tovered by secticfi 326.241 to 326.248. 

Subd. 3. OTHER UNITS. Planning, laying out, and installation of heating, 
ventifi, Er conditioning, or refrigeration units arfit meted by sectiohs 326.241 
to 326.248.—Eo_r purposes ofihis section, l-1eEnE—ventilating, E conditioning, or 
refiigeration units include, Eat}? not limited to, air conditioninghnits, air condition: 
ing evaporatfi air condEoiHng~c_ondense1§ a—ir conditioning £lTefrigeration 
Ellers, boilers, fufices, air handling units, rooftofinits, humidifiers, ice makers, and 
super market, ice arena, Ed bar/restaurant equipment. E installaticTn‘o_f electricfi 
wiring E fie coveEb_y sections 326.241 t_o 326.248. 

Subd. 4. OTHER EQUIPMENT. Planning, laying out, alteration, replacement, 
or repair oflheating, ventilating, air conditioning, or rei'—rigeration equipment, and 
a—ssociated—devices, controls, and wi—ring including wiring in or on the equipmenng 
not covered by sections 326T§l1 to 326.248 when the—wo?k—is?erformed byg 
employee of_a heating, ventilating, air conditioning_ or refrigeration contracter 
provided that ‘the employee performmg the work has_received a certificate of 
completiorrfinfi heating, ventilating, air cc>11—ditioning,Erefrigeratio1i apprenticeshfi 
program approved by the sta_te_ o_f Minnesota o_r E class—pf personal electrical license 

New language is -indicated by underline, deletions by strikeeut-.

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                



563 LAWS of MINNESOTA for 2002 Ch. 329 

issued by the board. Employees registered Q approved heating, ventilating, Q 
conditioning Q refrigeration program E design, plan, alter, replace, 95 repair 
heating, ventilating, air conditioning, or refrigeration equipment, devices, and controls 
including wiring in 6? on the equipmfit, under the direction of an employge who has 
a certificate of conipleticm Tr}->m an approved progTam or any claflsspbf personal egrictd 
license issued by the board. The_instal1ation pi’ electri_c-afwiring §tl1_e covered 
b_y sections 3261-21? to 326% 

Sec. 30. TERMS FOR POWER LIMITED CONTRACTORS. E term pi’ o_11e _o_f th_e power limited contractors appointed under Minnesota 
Statutes, section 326.241, subdivision 1, shall expire after two years. That person’s 
successor shall E appointed Q a four—year term. 

Sec. 31. REPEALER. 
Minnesota Rules, E 38003500, subpart lg repealed. 

Presented to the governor April 4, 2002 

Signed by the governor April 8, 2002, 4:15 p.m. 

CHAPTER 329--H.F.No. 3125 
An act relating to telecommunications; authorizing periodic account statements in elec- 

tronic format; changing name of telecommunications access for communication-impaired persons 
program to telecommunications access Minnesota program; modifying and clarifying provisions 
for contracting the telecommunication relay system; allowing the city of Alexandria to enter into 
a joint venture; amending Minnesota Statutes 2000, section 237.52, subdivision 1; Minnesota 
Statutes 2001 Supplement, sections 237.5], subdivision 1; 237.54, subdivision 2; proposing 
coding for new law in Minnesota Statutes, chapter 237. 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF MINNESOTA: 
Section 1. [237.101] ELECTRONIC BILLING. 
A telephone company may provide a customer’s periodic account statement to the 

customer electronic format _li_e_u o_f paper format me customer has authorized the 
electronic format writing. 

Sec. 2. Minnesota Statutes 2001 Supplement, section 237.51, subdivision 1, is 

amended to read: 
Subdivision 1. CREATION. The commissioner _of commerce shall (1) administer 

through interagency agreement with the commissioner of human service; program to 
distribute communication devices to eligible communication—impaired persons and (2) 
contract with a local consumer; group qualified vendor that serves communicatidn: 
impaired persons to create and maintain a telecommunication relay service. For 
purposes of sections 237.51 to 237.56, the department of commerce and any 

New language is indicated by underline, deletions by strileeent:

Copyright © 2002 by the Office of the Revisor of Statutes, State of Minnesota. All Rights Reserved.
                                                                                


