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streets 'or highways in the state shall become delinquent upon the expiration of seven days
after the same became due unless paid.

Sec. 4. Minnesota Statutes 1976, Section 169.01, Subdivision 5, is amended to read:

Subd. 5. AUTHORIZED EMERGENCY VEHICLE. "Authorized emergency
vehicle" means any of the following vehicles when equipped and identified according to
law: (1) A vehicle of a fire department; (2) a publicly owned police vehicle or a privately
owned vehicle used by a police officer for police work under agreemeni, express or
implied, with the local authority to which he is responsible; (3) an a vehicle of a licensed
land emergency ambulance service, whether publicly or privately owned; (4) an
emergency vehicle of a municipal department or a public service corporation, approved
by the commissioner of public safety or the chief of police of a municipality; (5) any
volunteer rescue squad operating pursuant to Laws 1959, Chapter 53.

Approved March 28, 1978.

CHAPTER 614-H.F.N0.1661

[Coded]

An act relating to pollution control; providing for publication in the state register of
certain behind schedule and substandard wastewater treatment projects.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF MINNESOTA:

Section 1. |115.83j DELINQUENT AND SUBSTANDARD WASTEWATER
TREATMENT PROJECTS; PUBLICATION. At the regularly scheduled meeting of the
pollution control agency in January of each year, the agency shall consider a draft list of
any principal consulting engineer, coniracting engineer or principal contractor for a
wastewater treatment project which, due to failures of design or workmanship, or other
factors within the reasonable control of the contractor or engineer, the agency determines
is either more than 90 days behind schedule or does not accomplish the purpose for which
it was designed or constructed. At least 30 days prior to the January meeting the agency
shall mail notice to any person whose name appears on the draft list. After the agency
considers the draft list in January, any person adversely affected may request to be heard
at a regularly scheduled meeting of the agency. At the regularly scheduled meeting of the
agency in March of each year, the agency shall issue an order incorporating a list of
engineers or contractors responsible for delinquent or substandard projects. Any person
adversely affected by the agency's order has the right of judicial review pursuant to
section 15.0424. On or before April I of each year, the pollution control agency shall
publish in the state register the list determined pursuant to this section. The state register
publication shall also include the name and address of the municipality or sanitary district
for which the work is being done, the nature of the deficiency with the project, and a
short description of the over-all project.

Sec. 2. This act shall expire January 1, 1985.
Approved March 28. 1978.
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